
James Addison attends Marist College and is pursuing a degree in Economics with a double minor of Global Studies and Cinema 
License/Coaching License.  James is the son of REALTOR® Lori (Gabby) Addison with Keller Williams in Ridgefield and a member of 
the Northern Fairfield County Association. 

Taylor Addison currently attends Temple University where she is majoring in Communications.  Taylor is the daughter of REALTOR® 
Lori (Gabby) Addison with Keller Williams in Ridgefield and a member of the Northern Fairfield County Association. 

Jamie Andrade is a 2022 graduate from St. Joseph High School.  She plans to attend Boston College in the fall and major in 
Business.  Jamie is the daughter of REALTOR® Lisa Andrade with Ellison Homes in Milford and a member of the New Haven 
Middlesex Association. 

Ava Bauknecht graduated from Sacred Heart Academy in June.  In the fall she will attend Emmanuel College and plans to major in 
Chemistry or Chemistry Education.  Ava is the daughter of REALTOR® Kurt Bauknecht with Sette Real Estate in Hamden and a 
member of the New Haven Middlesex Association. 

Gillianne Bolduc is attending the University of Maine Orono where she is majoring in Marketing.  Gillianne is the daughter of 
REALTOR® David Bolduc with The Bella Group in Warren and a member of the New Haven Middlesex Association. 

Kayden Burke graduated from South Windsor High School in June. With hopes to obtain a degree in Behavioral Neuroscience, she 
will attend College of the Holy Cross in the fall.  Kayden is the daughter of REALTOR® Brian Burke with Coldwell Banker in South 
Windsor and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Eliana Cambra attends Missouri State University where she is pursuing a Bachlor of Fine Arts in Acting.  Eliana is the daughter of 
REALTOR® Annunziata Cambra with Parkview Properties in Prospect and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Luca Cambra is a 2022 graduate from Woodland Regional High School. Looking to start a degree program in Entrepreneurship, he will 
attend the University of Tampa in the fall.  Luca is the son of REALTOR® Annunziata Cambra with Parkview Properties in Prospect 
and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

James Clark is currently attending Purdue University where he is working towards a degree in Engineering.  James is the son of 
REALTOR® Jamie Clark with Berkshire Hathaway HomeServices in Glastonbury and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Piper Cohen is a 2022 graduate from Staples High School.  In the fall she will attend Emory University and plans to major in Political 
Science.  Piper is the daughter of REALTOR® Meredith Cohen with William Raveis Real Estate in Westport and a member of the Mid-
Fairfield County Association. 

Rebecca Cohn just finished her freshman year at Georgetown University where she is majoring in Government with a minor in Justice 
and Peace Studies.  Rebecca is the daughter of REALTOR® Amara Alpert with CT Town and Country Realty in Colchester and a 
member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

2022
Scholarship Recipients 



Sarah Cole is a 2022 graduate from The Williams School. In the fall she will attend the University of San Diego and plans to major in 
Business Administration.  Sarah is the daughter of Designated REALTOR® Kristian Cole with Waterhouse Realty in Chester and a 
member of the New Haven Middlesex Association. 

Thomas Connolly currently attends the University of Connecticut where he is majoring in Finance with a minor in Spanish.  Thomas is 
the son of REALTOR®-Associate Kathryn Connolly with Houlihan Lawrence in Riverside and a member of the Greenwich Association. 

Madeline Davenport graduated from The Morgan School in June. Looking to start a degree in Elementary Education, she will head to 
East Stroudsburg University this fall.  Madeline is the daughter of REALTOR® Brenda Davenport with H. Pearce Real Estate in North 
Haven and a member of the New Haven Middlesex Association. 

Lyndsay Donston is a 2022 graduate from South Windsor High School. She plans to attend Springfield College where she’ll major in 
Physical Therapy.  Lyndsay is the daughter of REALTOR® Robert Donston with ERA Blanchard and Rossetto in Manchester and a 
member of the Tri-County Alliance. 

Ryan Duff currently attends Villanova University where he is pursuing a degree in Mechanical Engineering with a minor in Aerospace 
Engineering.  Ryan is the son of REALTOR® Robert Duff with William Pitt Sotheby’s in Westport and a member of the Mid-Fairfield 
County Association. 

Mike Ferris is a 2022 graduate from Forman School. Starting a degree in Finance with a minor in Business, Mike will attend UConn in 
the fall.  He is the son of REALTOR® Michael Ferris with Century 21 Classic Homes in Glastonbury and a member of the Gr. Hartford 
Association. 

Paulina Finz graduated from Greenwich High School in June.  In the fall she’ll attend the University of Richmond to start earning a 
degree in Education.  Paulina is the daughter of REALTOR®-Associate Noah Finz with Houlihan Lawrence in Riverside and a member 
of the Greenwich Association. 

Harrison Forland graduated from Wilton High School in June. In the fall he will be attending Bowdoin College where he will pursue a 
degree in Government with a minor in Political Science.  Harrison is the son of Designated REALTOR® Hans (Kris) Forland with 
Forland Realty Group in Wilton and a member of the Mid-Fairfield County Association. 

Clare Fusco graduated from Fairfield Ludlowe High School this year. Come September, she will be studying Chemistry with a minor in 
Italian at the University of Virginia.  Clare is the daughter of REALTOR® Ellen Fusco with Compass in Fairfield and a member of the 
Gr. Fairfield Board. 

Gavin Fusco is a 2022 graduate from Wilton High School. He has committed to attend Rensselaer Polytechnic Institute where he 
would like to study Computer Science.  Gavin is the son of REALTOR® Lori Fusco with William Pitt Sotheby’s International Realty in 
Westport and a member of the Mid-Fairfield County Association. 

John Gatt currently attends the University of Florida where he is majoring in Economics.  John is the son of REALTOR® Meghan Gatt 
with William Raveis in Darien and a member of the Darien Board. 

Rachel Goldschmidt is a 2022 graduate from CREC Academy of Aerospace & Engineering. In the fall she will attend Simmons 
University to pursue a degree in Biology.  Rachel is the daughter of REALTORS® Melissa and David Goldschmidt with Berkshire 
Hathaway HomeServices in West Hartford and members of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Michael Guastamachio currently attends The Pennsylvania State University. He is pursuing multiple degrees including a Bachlor of 
Fine Arts in Theatre Design and Technology with a Bachelor’s degree in both Theatre and Telecommunications.  Michael is the son of 
REALTOR® Peter Guastamachio with Executive Real Estate in Glastonbury and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Beau Hancock graduated from Darien High School this year. While he doesn’t know the specific degree he’ll be working towards, he 
will attend Washington and Lee University in the fall.  Beau is the son of REALTOR® Julia Hancock with Houlihan Lawrence and a 
member of the Darien Board. 

Jessica Hart currently attends Springfield College where she is working towards her Doctor of Physical Therapy.  Jessica is the 
daughter of REALTOR® Kerry Hart with Willliam Raveis Real Estate in Wethersfield and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 



Mitchell Hart attends the University of Hartford. He is majoring in Exercise Science.  Mitchell is the son of REALTOR® Kerry Hart with 
WIlliam Raveis Real Estate in Wethersfield and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Karen Hawash is a 2022 graduate from Kolbe Cathedral. In the fall she will attend Fairfield University to pursue a degree in Business 
with a minor in Finance.  Karen is the daughter of REALTOR® Akmal Hawash with Crearth Real Estate in Bridgeport and a member of 
the Gr. Bridgeport Board. 

Jack Huscher is a 2022 graduate from Coginchaug Regional High School.  Hoping to major in Finance, Jack will attend Iona College 
in the fall.  He is the son of REALTOR® Debbie Huscher with William Raveis in Middletown and a member of the Gr. Hartford 
Association. 

Lauren Lagasse attends Marist College and is majoring in Communications with a double minor in Creative Writing and Fashion 
Merchandising.  Lauren is the daughter of REALTOR® Larry Lagasse with Coldwell Banker in South Windsor and a member of the Tri-
County Alliance. 

Brooke Latone currently attends the University of Delaware. She is majoring in Hospitality Business with a minor in Industry 
Management.  Brooke is the daughter of REALTOR® Gail Latone with William Raveis in Wilton and a member of the Mid-Fairfield 
County Association. 

Alexandra Leso attends Southern Connecticut State University and is studying Finance with a minor in Real Estate.  Alexandra is the 
daughter of REALTOR® Mark Leso, Esq. with Esquire Real Estate in Milford and a member of the Gr. Bridgeport Board. 

Emma Lieberman currently attends University of Alabama.  She intends on getting a BS in Microbiology and a STEM-focused MBA.  
Emma is the daughter of REALTOR® Brett Lieberman with The Riverside Realty Group in Westport and a member of the Mid-Fairfield 
County Association. 

Lance Longo is a 2022 graduate from Joseph A. Foran High School.  He will attend Loyola University in pursuit of a Political Science 
degree.  Lance is the son of REALTOR® Lance Longo with S.E.L. Realty in Fairfield and a member of the Mid-Fairfield County 
Association. 

Ella Magnuson attends the University of Denver where she is majoring in Communication Studies.  Ella is the daughter of 
REALTOR®-Associate Steven Magnuson with Douglas Elliman in Greenwich and a member of the Greenwich Association. 

Alex Maric currently attends the University of Connecticut. He is working towards an advanced degree in Electrical and Computer 
Engineering.  Alex is the son of REALTOR® Charles Maric with McCorrison D.W. Fish in Hebron and a member of the Gr. Hartford 
Association. 

James McPherson currently attends Louisiana Tech University where he is pursuing a degree in Mechanical Engineering.  James is 
the son of REALTOR® Joscelyn McPherson with Priority Real Estate Group in Lisbon and a member of the Eastern CT Association. 

Stella Meier graduated from Darien High School in June.  In the fall she will attend Brigham Young University where she plans to major 
in Molecular Biology with a minor in Women's Studies.  Stella is the daughter of REALTOR® Darleen Meier with Houlihan Lawrence in 
Darien and a member of the Darien Board. 

Sophia Menoutis graduated from Canton High School this year. Looking to pursue a degree in Marketing, she will attend the 
University of Connecticut in the fall.  Sophia is the daughter of REALTOR® Rania Menoutis with Carol Cole Real Estate in Canton and 
a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Bryce Metalios is a 2022 graduate from Greenwich High School.  While he currently does not know what his major will be, Bryce will 
attend the Massachusetts Institute of Technology in the fall.  He is the son of REALTOR®-Associate Joy Metalios with Houlihan 
Lawrence in Greenwich and a member of the Greenwich Association. 

Natalie Modiano graduated from Amity Regional High School in June. She will attend the University of Connecticut in the fall, 
undecided in a major.  Natalie is the daughter of Designated REALTOR® Ronny Modiano with Amity Realty Group in Waterbury and a 
member of the Mid-State Association. 



Dana Normandie recently graduated from Quinebaug Valley Community College in May with a degree in Computer Science.  She will 
be attending graduate school in the fall.  Dana is the daughter of REALTOR® Sarah Normandie with Weichert REALTORS®-Four 
Corners in Storrs and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Nora O'Connell is a 2022 graduate from Coginchaug Regional High School. She will attend the University of North Carolina at Chapel 
Hill and wants to major in Biomedical Engineering.  Nora is the daughter of REALTOR® Claudia O’Connell with William Raveis Real 
Estate in Middletown and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 

Paige Pallarino graduated from St Joseph High School in June. In the fall she will pursue a degree in Dental Hygiene at Regis 
College.  Paige is the daughter of REALTOR® Susan Pallarino with East Coast Associates in Norwalk and a member of the Mid-
Fairfield County Association. 

Jack Rosier recently graduated from Staples High School. He will be attending Indiana University in the fall to start a degree in 
Accounting.  Jack is the son of REALTOR® Michelle Katz with The Higgins Group in Fairfield and a member of the Mid-Fairfield County 
Association. 

Jake Saldutti is a 2022 graduate from North Branford High School. In the fall he will attend the University of Connecticut to pursue a 
degree in Management.  Jake is the step-son of REALTOR® Nikki Travaglino with William Pitt Sotheby's International in Guilford and a 
member of the New Haven Middlesex Association. 

Eman Seyal graduated from Trumbull High School in June. She will attend Harvard University and earn a degree in Molecular and 
Cellular Biology.  Eman is the daughter of REALTOR® Atif Seyal with RE/MAX Heritage in Westport and a member of the Gr. 
Bridgeport Board. 

Timothy Sigler recently graduated from South Windsor High School. Looking to start a degree in Finance, Timothy will attend UConn 
in the fall.  Timothy is the son of REALTOR® Jonathan Sigler with Coldwell Banker Realty in South Windsor and a member of the Gr. 
Hartford Association. 

Alexandra (Gracie) Spataro is a 2022 graduate from Darien High School and in the fall will pursue a degree in Education with a minor 
in History at Gettysburg College.  Gracie is the daughter of REALTOR® Lauren Spataro with Houlihan Lawrence in Darien and a 
member of the Darien Board. 

Maxwell Tanksley graduated from Staples High School in June and will pursue a Bachelor’s degree at Yale University.  Maxwell is the 
son of REALTOR® Timothy Tanksley with William Pitt Sotheby's International in Westport and a member of the Mid-Fairfield County 
Association. 

Christopher Tatusko graduated from Staples High School this year. In the fall he will attend St. Bonaventure University to start a 
degree in International Business and Journalism.  Christopher is the son of REALTOR® Janet Tatusko with William Pitt Southeby’s in 
Southport and a member of the Mid-Fairfield County Association. 

Lily Traum currently attends Springfield College where she is pursuing a degree in Recreation Management with double minors of 
YMCA Professional Studies and Adventure Education.  Lily is the daughter of REALTOR® Michael Traum with RE/MAX Heritage in 
Westport and a member of the Gr. Fairfield Board. 

Amanda Tressel graduated from Lyman Hall High School this year. In the fall she will attend Southern Connecticut State University to 
start her degree in Nursing.  Amanda is the daughter of REALTOR® Laura Tressel Carbone with Wareck D'Ostilio Houlihan Lawrence 
in Branford and a member of the New Haven Middlesex Association. 

Ekaterina Ulyanov attends Williams College where she is majoring in Physics.  Ekaterina is the daughter of REALTOR®-Associate 
Tatiana Ulyanov with Coldwell Banker in Greenwich and a member of the Greenwich Association. 

Christina Wasiczko is in her second year at the University of Connecticut and is majoring in Finance.  Christina is the daughter of 
REALTOR® Joanna Wasiczko with Scalzo Real Estate in Bethel and a member of the Northern Fairfield County Association. 

Delton Wentworth currently attends the University of Connecticut where he is majoring in Engineering Physics with a concentration in 
Mechanical Engineering.  Delton is the son of Designated REALTOR® Gina Russo Wentworth with Lebanon Green Real Estate in 
Lebanon and a member of the Gr. Hartford Association. 



 
Riley Wilson currently attends the University of Virginia (College of Arts and Sciences).  There she is working towards a double major 
in commerce and computer science.  Riley is the daughter of REALTOR® Suzanne Wilson with Coldwell Banker in New Canaan and a 
member of the New Canaan Board. 
 
Sydney Young is a 2022 graduate from Avon High School. She will attend Trinity College and major in Dance with a minor in 
Economics.  Sydney is the daughter of REALTOR® Melissa Young with Berkshire Hathaway HomeServices in Avon and a member of 
the Gr. Hartford Association. 
 
 
 

 
 

The Foundation is pleased to highlight scholarships awarded yearly in honor of CT REALTORS® Past Presidents who have 
recently passed away.  Four applicants have been selected to receive this year’s tribute scholarships in memory of 1995 Past 

President Frank Green from the Stamford Board of REALTORS®, 1974 Past President Joe Gustin from the Mid-State 
Association of REALTORS®, 2012 Past President Bob Kimball from the Eastern CT Association of REALTORS® and 1996 

Past President Larry Story from the New Canaan Board of REALTORS®. 
 
 
Frank Green Tribute Scholarship 
 
Vedant Gannu currently attends Rensselaer Polytechnic Institute with one year left until he earns a Bachelor's degree in Computer 
Science with a minor in Computer and Systems Engineering.  Vedant is the son of REALTOR® Sonali Zullurwar with Keller Williams 
Prestige Properties in Stamford and a member of the Stamford Board. 
 
Joe Gustin Tribute Scholarship 
 
Maya Winkleman graduated from Plainville High School this year. In the fall she will attend UConn to pursue a degree in Biology.  
Maya is the daughter of REALTOR® Seth Winkleman with Berkshire Hathaway in Farmington and a member of the Mid-State 
Association. 
 
Bob Kimball Tribute Scholarship 
 
Katie Johnstone graduated from Stonington High School this year. She will attend Bentley University and major in Business with a 
minor in marketing.  Katie is the daughter of REALTOR® Laurie Johnstone with Berkshire Hathaway HomeServices in Mystic and a 
member of the Eastern CT Association. 
 
Larry Story Tribute Scholarship 
 
Lily Donzeiser is a 2022 graduate from Darien High School.  In the fall she’ll attend the University of California, Berkeley where she 
plans to major in Environmental Sciences.  Lily is the daughter of REALTOR® Michelle Donzeiser with Compass in Darien and a 
member of the Darien Board. 
 


